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FUNDRAISER CELEBRATION TO BE HELD FOR JONES FAMILY 
 

BRANDON, MS--This Friday, February 2nd, Crossgates Baptist 
Church, along with Shoemaker Homes, the American Red Cross, and 
Extreme Makeover: Home Edition, will hold a fundraising 
celebration for Sabrena Jones and her family. The event will include 
a concert by the Crossgates Baptist Church Choir, and organizers 
are confirming other participants in preparation for an evening of 
fantastic entertainment. Sabrena Jones is a member of the 
Crossgates Baptist Church Choir. As David Oliver, Crossgates 
Minister of Music, describes her,"Sabrena is one of those people 
who is always caring and ministering to others. The way she lives 
her life, you never would have known their needs. She has done an 
excellent job of raising her children." Biloxi guests aided by the 
$500,000 Katrina relief fund that Sabrena helped distribute will be 
in attendance. This event will celebrate the Jones family's selfless 
efforts to better their community and will provide an opportunity 
for the community to give back. The public is invited to attend.  
 

-MORE- 



Crossgates Baptist Church is located at 8 Crosswoods Road in  
Brandon, MS. 

# # # 
 

Extreme Makeover: Home Edition has won back-to-back Emmy Awards as the Best 

Reality Program (non-competitive) and is in its 4th season on ABC. The program is 

produced by Endemol USA, a division of Endemol Holding. David Goldberg is the 

president of Endemol USA.  Executive producer is Denise Cramsey 

 

MEDIA NOTE: Media are welcome near the site for the duration of 
the build and must check in at Shiloh Park.  A Location Press ID is 
required. News releases and other media materials about the build 
will be available via www.shoemakerhomes.com, onsite, and 
through the listed media contacts. 
 For more information about the show/designers, contact Molly 
Harper, ABC publicist, at 323-707-2381. 
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